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Constitutional Court Removes 
President Yoon Suk Yeol 

In April, the Constitutional Court of South 
Korea announced that the ruling on 
President Yoon Suk Yeol’s impeachment 
would be declared on 4th day of the month. 
The acting South Korean President Han 
Duck-soo called upon for maintaining 
peace in the country and urged political 
leaders to refrain from inciting violence on 
the issue of Constitutional Court’s verdict 
on Yoon. Later, on April 4, the 
Constitutional Court passed the verdict 
which upheld the impeachment of 
President Yoon by the National Assembly 
in December 2024. The unanimous 
decision of all eight judges of the 
Constitutional Court was in favour to 
remove President Yoon from his post, and 
he became the second sitting president in 
South Korea after Park Geun-hye to be 
removed through the impeachment 
process. The ruling against Yoon was 
stated to be final and cannot be challenged. 
According to the reports in South Korean 
media, the impeached President Yoon 
could further face investigation into 
charges against him. Also, the verdict by 
the Constitutional Court paved the way for 
fresh presidential election in the country, 
which would possibly be held by the early 
June 2025. As per the law, South Korea 
must conduct election within 60 days to 
fill the vacancy of presidential position. In 
the upcoming presidential election, Lee 
Jae-myung of the Democratic Party of 
Korea is a strong candidate as the next 
president of South Korea.  

 

Massive Destruction by the Wildfires 
in South Korea 

In April 2025, South Korea was in the 
process of rehabilitation work to overcome 
the damages caused by the wildfires in the 
country. In March 2025, the southeastern 
part of South Korea was engulfed in 
massive wildfires. The spread of fire in the 
forested mountainous regions led to the 
destruction of life and property. These 
deadly wildfires were reported to be 
unprecedented and most damaging in the 
history of South Korea. Several historical 
monuments located in the forested areas 
were also damaged due to the ravaging 
fire. It was reported that it would take 
about a century for the forest areas to fully 
recover due to the damages caused by the 
fire. According to the reports in April, the 
total number of deaths due to the recent 
wildfires rose to 31 and it destroyed 4,015 
houses. The South Korean government 
planned to support those people who lost 
their homes and rebuild their houses.  
Notably, the wildfires badly affected the 
older people who constitute a large 
proportion of the rural population in South 
Korea. An Indonesian national working in 
South Korea received praises for rescuing 
several elderly people from the ravages of 
the fire. Also, it was reported that the fire 
extinguishing trucks built by Mercedes-
Benz played a crucial role in containing 
the wildfires. In a separate report, wildfires 
broke out inside the demilitarized zone 
(DMZ) which divides North and South 
Korea. 

https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10455090
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10456406
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-04/national/politics/Constitutional-Court-rules-to-impeach-Korean-President-Yoon-Suk-Yeol/2277754
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10458013
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/southkorea/politics/20250404/what-comes-next-for-impeached-president
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/southkorea/politics/20250404/s-koreas-president-yoon-suk-yeol-impeached
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/southkorea/politics/20250404/presidential-election-to-be-held-within-2-months
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10458215
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/southkorea/environment-animals/20250327/korea-grapples-with-worst-wildfires-in-its-history
https://www.aljazeera.com/news/2025/3/27/south-korea-says-wildfires-worst-in-its-history-death-toll-rises-to-26
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-03-26/national/socialAffairs/15-heritage-sites-damaged-or-destroyed-by-North-Gyeongsang-wildfires-more-under-threat/2271140
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/southkorea/environment-animals/20250402/koreas-wildfire-hit-forests-need-century-to-recover-study
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10455857
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-01/national/socialAffairs/For-wildfire-evacuees-returning-home-may-be-a-long-difficult-path/2275062
https://english.hani.co.kr/arti/english_edition/e_national/1190073.html
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-01/national/socialAffairs/North-Gyeongsang-village-residents-praise-Indonesian-fisher-who-saved-elderly-from-wildfire/2275004
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-02/national/socialAffairs/Specialized-Mercedes-fire-engines-prove-gamechangers-in-battle-against-Korean-wildfires/2276143?detailWord=
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-11/national/socialAffairs/Firefighters-battling-wildfire-in-DMZ-near-Goseong-County/2282956
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South Korea Braces for Tariffs by 
the United States 

In April 2025, the South Korean business 
groups were reported to be looking for 
ways to overcome the protectionist trade 
measures imposed by the Donald Trump 
administration in the United States. 
According to a survey, about 60 percent of 
the manufacturers in South Korea could be 
affected directly or indirectly by the new 
tariffs imposed by the United States. South 
Korean company Samsung was stated to 
face challenges due to the subsidy cuts and 
pressure for investment in the United 
States. The acting South Korean President 
Han Duck-soo pledged to support major 
companies in the country against the new 
tariffs by Trump administration. Later, it 
was reported that United States imposed 
26 percent “reciprocal” tariffs on the South 
Korean products. Following this 
development, the South Korean 
government called for an “emergency 
meeting” to discuss on Seoul’s response to 
the American tariffs. During the meeting 
acting President Han vowed for “all-out 
response” against tariffs imposed by the 
United States. The South Korean financial 
institutions such as Hana Financial Group 
geared to respond to the tariffs imposed by 
Trump administration on imports from 
South Korea. According to the reports, the 
planned new tariffs against semiconductor 
imports by Trump could also adversely 
impact South Korean chip producing 
companies. Later, the finance and trade 
authorities of South Korea and United 
States held a meeting in Washington DC to 
ease the tariffs imposed by the Trump 
administration.  

U.S. President Donald Trump and 
North Korea  

In April, it was reported in the South 
Korean media that the Donald Trump 
administration in United States was in 
“communication” with the North Korean 
regime. Trump even referred North Korea 
as a “big nuclear nation”. Also, there is a 
possibility for restarting of talks between 
North Korea and the US. During a phone 
call to the South Korean acting President, 
Trump was vocal about his friendly 
relationship with Pyongyang, which 
caused concerns in Seoul. Interestingly, 
the American president called North 
Korean leader Kim Jong-un as a “smart 
guy”, whom Trump had once termed a 
“Little Rocket Man”. Notably, soon after 
his inauguration as the president in January 
2025, Trump had conveyed his desire to 
“reach out” to the leadership in North 
Korea under Kim Jong-un, and even called 
Pyongyang a “nuclear power”. According 
to a report in the South Korean media, 
Trump repeated his categorisation of North 
Korea as a nuclear power in March 2025 
and expressed his desire to restart 
negotiations with Pyongyang. However, in 
April, Trump’s nominee for the Joint 
Chiefs of Staff chairman labeled North 
Korea’s nuclear weapons programme as an 
“immediate security challenge” to the 
United States. On the other hand, the 
North Korean regime remained 
apprehensive of America’s military 
alliance with South Korea and Japan. 
According to North Korea, it would not 
tolerate the military hegemony of the US 
and its allies in the region. 

https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/business/companies/20250402/south-korean-steelmakers-search-for-answers-to-us-protectionism
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/business/companies/20250401/6-in-10-korean-manufacturers-say-us-tariffs-will-impact-their-biz-survey-shows
https://english.hani.co.kr/arti/english_edition/e_business/1190274.html
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-01/business/industry/-Acting-President-Han-Ducksoo-asks-Koreas-business-leaders-to-unite-against-incoming-Trump-tariffs/2275312
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/business/20250403/us-to-impose-25-reciprocal-tariff-on-south-korea
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10456864
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10456864
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-03/national/politics/Acting-president-calls-for-allout-response-to-US-tariffs/2276717
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-03/national/politics/Acting-president-calls-for-allout-response-to-US-tariffs/2276717
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10458225
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-04/business/economy/Trump-says-tariffs-on-semiconductors-will-start-very-soon/2277675
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/foreignaffairs/others/20250425/korea-us-agree-to-seek-july-package-aimed-at-eliminating-tariffs
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-01/national/diplomacy/Trump-confirms-communication-with-Kim-Jongun/2275191
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10455402
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-28/national/northKorea/US-State-Department-White-House-reportedly-preparing-for-talks-with-North/2295309
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-13/national/northKorea/Worries-rise-in-Seoul-after-Trump-boasts-about-Kim-Jongun-relationship/2282597
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10455402
https://www.koreaherald.com/article/10455402
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/foreignaffairs/northkorea/20250124/trump-announces-plan-to-reach-out-to-north-korean-leader-kim-again
https://english.hani.co.kr/arti/english_edition/e_northkorea/1187779.html
https://koreajoongangdaily.joins.com/news/2025-04-02/world/world/Top-US-general-nominee-calls-North-Korea-immediate-security-challenge-backs-trilateral-cooperation-with-Japan/2275753
https://www.koreatimes.co.kr/foreignaffairs/northkorea/20250409/north-korean-leaders-sister-slams-south-korea-us-japan-pledge-to-denuclearize-north-korea-as-most-hostile-act
http://kcna.kp/en/article/q/f8d652dc0f15b78975cbea906b4bdca1.kcmsf

